
 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

Ware Washing Compound, Machine,
Capsules 1,350 EA $93.59 126,346.5000$  $85.06 114,831.0000$  $88.17 119,029.5000$  

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Ware Washing Compound, Machine,
Liquid 1,350 EA $72.27 97,564.5000$    116.96$           157,896.0000$   $65.68 88,668.0000$    $63.55 85,792.5000$    

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco

Blaze
2397300

4
5

PINT
88.17$                                          
22.04$                                          

0.20000000
0.0340$                                        

Ecolab

All Temp Machine Detergent
2447800

1
5

GL
63.55$                                          
63.55$                                          

0.30000000
0.1660$                                        

Spartan
Spartan Chemical SparClean

5 Gallon All Temperature
SPA7650-05

1
5

GL
116.96$                                        
116.96$                                        

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

0.00200000

Super Trump
6112740

18.07$                                          16.42$                                          

1 1
GL GL

0.00164063

72.27$                                          65.68$                                          

0.0002$                                        0.0000$                                        

No Bid

6112740

21.27$                                          

4

LB

6100185

9

93.59$                                          

0.00062500
23.40$                                          

Ecolab

Solid Power XL Capsules
6100185

9No Bid

85.06$                                          

0.02500000

4

LB

0.0001$                                        0.0003$                                        

No Bid

National Everything Wholesale

4 4
2-O

Ecolab Ecolab

Super Trump

Ecolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

1-O

Ecolab

Solid Power XL Capsules
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EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
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EXTENDED
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Pot & Pan Machine Washing Detergent,
Encapsulated Granular Solid,
Maximum of 9LB/PK

175 EA $79.76 13,958.0000$    $69.70 12,197.5000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Pot & Pan Machine Washing Detergent,
Granular Powder,
Maximum of 9LB/PK

175 EA $69.70 12,197.5000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

8
LB

69.70$                                          
17.43$                                          

0.00200000
0.0000$                                        

Ecolab
Solid Metal Pro

6110751
4
8

LB
69.70$                                          
17.43$                                          

0.00200000
0.0000$                                        

Ecolab
Solid Metal Pro

6110751
4
8

LB
No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

69.70$                                          
17.43$                                          

0.00200000
0.0000$                                        

No Bid

Ecolab
Solid Metal Pro

6110751
4

3-P

No Bid4-P
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Max Strength Manual Pot Wash Detergent,
Maximum of 5 GL Pails 20 EA $122.75 2,455.0000$      76.44$             1,528.8000$       $107.28 2,145.6000$      $97.67 1,953.4000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Manual Dish Detergent, Liquid,
Maximum of 5 LB 375 EA $72.79 27,296.2500$    $66.15 24,806.2500$    $64.00 24,000.0000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

0.25000000
6.6260$                                        

18510500
1
5

GL
97.67$                                          
97.67$                                          

0.25000000
0.5720$                                        

Betco
Insync

1851B900
8
38
OZ

64.00$                                          
8.00$                                            

Betco

Insync

Spartan
Spartan Chemical SparClean Pot 

and Pan Detergent 5 Gallon 
Manual Dish Detergent

SPA7656-05
1
5

GL
76.44$                                          
76.44$                                          

0.0000$                                        0.0001$                                        

No Bid

No Bid

16.54$                                          

5

No Bid

0.0000$                                        

0.00050000

GL

107.28$                                        
107.28$                                        

0.00080000

Pantastic
6112963 6112963

GL
72.79$                                          66.15$                                          

4 4
1 1

Ecolab

GL

6113505
1 1

5-Q

Ecolab Ecolab

Monsoon Monsoon
6113505

0.0001$                                        

6-R

Ecolab

5

122.75$                                        
122.75$                                        

0.00078125

Pantastic

18.20$                                          

GL

0.00097656
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Manual Dish Detergent, Powder,
Maximum of 5 LB 375 EA $100.24 37,590.0000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Manual Dish Detergent,
Solid Enclosed in a pouch
Maximum of 5 LB

375 EA $114.70 43,012.5000$    $100.24 37,590.0000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

No Bid

0.0001$                                        

No BidNo Bid No Bid

No Bid

Solitaire Solid Detergent
6117301

No Bid

0.0000$                                        

0.0000$                                        

25.06$                                          
0.00030000

LB

100.24$                                        

No Bid
4

5 5

Solitaire Solid Detergent
6117301 6117301

Ecolab Ecolab
Solitaire

28.68$                                          25.06$                                          
0.00029297 0.00030000

LB LB
114.70$                                        

100.24$                                        

4
5

Ecolab

8-R

7-R

4
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Manual Dish Detergent,
Solid Enclosed in a pod
Maximum of 5 LB

375 EA $100.24 37,590.0000$    

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Residential Dishwasher Pods,
Cascade or EQUIVALENT
Maximum of 35 pods per PK

225 EA 8.68$               1,953.0000$       33.38$             7,510.5000$      $32.13 7,229.2500$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Cascade

ctionPacs Dishwasher Detergent Po
80675CT

5
25

Pods
32.13$                                          
6.43$                                            

No Bid

5
LB

N/A

Cascade ActionPacs Fesh Scent 
Tablet Dishwasher Detergent (25-

Count) Cascade ActionPacs

No Bid

No Bid
80675

N/A

100.24$                                        
25.06$                                          

0.00030000$                                
0.0000$                                        

Ecolab
Solitaire Solid Detergent

No BidNo Bid

33.38$                                          

25 5
1 25

12-S

Cascade PG

0.35$                                            6.68$                                            
N/A N/A

Pods EA
8.68$                                            

Item# 309029139

6117301
4

9-R No Bid
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, Liquid
Maximum of 5 GL 9 EA 86.34$             777.0600$         116.96$           1,052.6400$       78.47$             706.2300$         $63.55 571.9500$         

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash, Powder
Maximum of 5 GL 9 EA $72.95 656.5500$         

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

1
5

GL
63.55$                                          
63.55$                                          

0.00500000
0.1660$                                        

Cascade
Diswashing Detergent

PGC5935CT
7
75
OZ

72.95$                                          
10.42$                                          

Betco
All Temp Machine Detergent

2447800

0.0001$                                        

p p
5 Gallon All Temperature

SPA7650-05
1
5

No BidNo BidNo Bid

5

ET Ultra Klene
6112716 6112716

No Bid

Ecolab Ecolab
ower DishMachine Detergent All Pu

86.34$                                          78.47$                                          
0.00093750$                                0.00100000$                                

GL GL
86.34$                                          78.47$                                          

1 1
No Bid

0.0000$                                        

Spartan

13-T
GL

116.96$                                        
116.96$                                        

14-T

5
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash,
Solid Enclosed in a Pouch
Maximum of 5 GL

9 EA

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Low Temperature Dish Machine Wash,
Solid Enclosed in a Pod 9 EA $88.17 793.5300$         

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco
Blaze

2397300
4
5

PINT
88.17$                                          
22.04$                                          

0.01600000
0.0340$                                        

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid No Bid

No Bid16-T

15-T

No Bid
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Rinse Dish Machine Additive Solid
Maximum of 2.5 LB Container 25 EA 183.58$           4,589.5000$      166.87$           4,171.7500$      $74.78 1,869.5000$      

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Rinse Aid and Detergent
Maximum of 2.5 LB Container 190 EA 175.30$           33,307.0000$    159.34$           30,274.6000$    

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

5
PINT

74.78$                                          
74.78$                                          

0.01600000
0.6200$                                        

Betco
Krystal Rinse Aid

268A300
1

0.00026417
0.0006$                                        

0.0006$                                        

175.30$                                        

0.0000$                                        

0.0000$                                        

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

159.34$                                        

6116811

18-V

Ecolab Ecolab

Solid Brilliance

87.65$                                          79.67$                                          
0.00026417$                                0.00003000$                                

LB LB

Ecolab
SmartPower Rinse Additive

91.79$                                          83.44$                                          

2 2
2.5 2.5

0.00003000

LB LB
183.58$                                        166.87$                                        

2 2
2.5 2.5

Apex Rinse Additive
6101203

No Bid

No Bid

Solid Brilliance
6125395 6125395

Ecolab

17-U
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EXTENDED
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Super Concentrated Rinse Aid for Residential
Dishwasher,
Lemi Shine or EQUIVALENT
Maximum of 24 OZ Containers

500 EA 36.18$             18,090.0000$    

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Rinse Additive, Liquid,
1 GL Containers,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

500 EA -$               

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco
All Temp Rinse Aid

2457400
6
1

GL
-$                                             
-$                                             

0.00300000
0.0210$                                        

0.0137$                                        

Finish Jet Dry
75713

No Bid No Bid19-W

Reckitt Benkiser

4.52$                                            
0.49500000$                                

OZ
36.18$                                          

8.00
8.45

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid20-X
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PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
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UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
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UNIT
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EXTENDED
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Dishwasher Temperature Tape,
TL3-150 Paper Thermometer or EQUIVALENT 500 EA No Bid No Bid

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Laundry Destainer, Liquid
55 GL Drum,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTIONS

6 EA 531.55$           3,189.3000$       665.00$           3,990.0000$      $609.37 3,656.2200$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco

Distainer 300
4775500

1
55
GL

609.37$                                        
609.37$                                        

0.05000000
0.4300$                                        

No Bid

No Bid

0.0002$                                        

EcoStar Destainer

531.55$                                        

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

22-Z

Ecolab

665.00$                                        
0.10000000

GL

21-Y No Bid

665.00$                                        

1

Ecolab
Dishwasher Temp Labels 160F

409020111
1
24
CS

No Bid
No Bid

N/A
N/A

N/A

Spartan
Spartan Clothesline Fresh 55 

Gallon Chlorine Bleach
SPA7004-55

1
55
GL

531.55$                                        

55

6116144
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EXTENDED
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UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
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ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Residential Laundry Stain Remover Pods,
Clorox ll or EQUIVALENT,
Maximum of 32 pods per PK

220 EA

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Concentrated Laundry Detergent, 
Maximum of 5 GL per Pail 50 EA 149.00$           7,450.0000$      99.12$             4,956.0000$       135.43$           6,771.5000$      $76.62 3,831.0000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco

SymplicityTM Detergent
4710400

4
1

GL
76.62$                                          
19.16$                                          

1.00000000
0.1800$                                        0.0002$                                        0.0010$                                        

Spartan

No BidNo BidNo Bid

No Bid

Laundry Detergent Plus
Clothesline Fresh Clothesline 

Fresh 5 Gallon Laundry Detergent
SPA7003-05

1
5

GL
99.12$                                          
99.12$                                          

135.43$                                        

1 1
5 524-BB

Ecolab Ecolab

Liquid Laundry Built Detergent

149.00$                                        135.43$                                        
0.00078125 0.14000000

GL GL
149.00$                                        

6101849

No Bid23-AA No Bid

6101849
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Residential Laundry Pods for Sensitive Skin,
High Efficiency (HE) Washers,
All Free & All Clear or EQUIVALENT,
Maximum of 75 pods per PK

235 EA

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Concentrated Laundry Bleach,
5 GL Pails Only
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

75 EA 59.48$             4,461.0000$      52.81$             3,960.7500$       59.46$             4,459.5000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

1

No Bid

5
GL

52.81$                                          
52.81$                                          

SPA7004-05
1

0.00062500

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

59.46$                                          

0.10000000

No BidNo Bid

1
5 5

Laundry Destainer
6115982 6115982

Ecolab Ecolab

Liquid Laundry Chlorine Bleach

59.48$                                          59.46$                                          

0.0001$                                        0.0017$                                        

GL GL
59.48$                                          

Spartan

Spartan Chemical Co. Clothesline 
Fresh 5 Gallon Chlorine Bleach

25-CC No Bid

26-DD
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Concentrated Laundry Bleach,
1 GL Pails Only,
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

150 EA 43.73$             6,559.5000$       

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Concentrated Laundry Softener,
Maximum of 5 GL Pail 40 EA 90.89$             3,635.6000$      93.24$             3,729.6000$       82.61$             3,304.4000$      $90.07 3,602.8000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco

Softener 500
4827800

1
5

GL
90.07$                                          
90.07$                                          

0.20000000
0.1400$                                        

No Bid

Liquid Laundry Softener
6114310

90.89$                                          

0.0000$                                        

93.24$                                          
93.24$                                          

No Bid

Spartan
Spartan Chemical Co. Clothesline 
Fresh 1 Gallon Chlorine Bleach (4 

per pack)
SPA7004-04

4
1

Spartan

5
GL

0.0008$                                        
0.070000000.00031250

No Bid

No Bid27-EE

82.61$                                          

1 1
5 5

No Bid

28-FF

Ecolab Ecolab

90.89$                                          82.61$                                          

GL

GL
43.73$                                          
10.93$                                          

So Fresh Laundry Softener
6114310

GL

Spartan Chemical Co. Clothesline 
Fresh 5 Gallon Fabric Softener

SPA7006-05
1
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Fabric Softener, Liquid
55 GL Drum
NO SIZE SUBSTITUES

4 EA 1,169.44$        4,677.7600$       

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Continental Mister Fresh Odor Encapsulator 
and Fabric Refresher,
1 QT/PK, 12 PK/CS
NO BRAND,PRODUCT OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

36 EA

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

No Bid

No Bid

Spartan
Spartan Clothesline Fresh 55 

Lavender Linen Fabric Softener X 
55 Gallon Drum

Item # 312187309
1 No BidNo Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid29-GG
55
GL

1,169.44$                                     
1,169.44$                                     

No Bid No Bid30-HH
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Lime Solvent, Liquid
1 GL Containers 300 EA 39.13$             11,739.0000$    64.83$             19,449.0000$     37.90$             11,370.0000$    $32.06 9,618.0000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Lime Solvent, Encapsulated Solid,
1 GL Containers 300 EA 93.22$             27,966.0000$    

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

32.06$                                          
8.02$                                            

1.00000000
0.1500$                                        

Betco

LSR Delimer
25990400

4
1

GL

No Bid

6101131

1

0.0006$                                        

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

0.0002$                                        

No Bid

Solid LimeAway
6115905

0.0001$                                        

32-II

Ecolab

15.54$                                          
0.01100000

LB

Spartan Ecolab

Lime-A-Way

9.78$                                            16.21$                                          9.48$                                            
0.00781250 0.00800000

GL GL GL
39.13$                                          64.83$                                          37.90$                                          

4
1

SparClean 1 Gal. Delimer (4 per 
Pack) LimeAway

1

SPA7655-04-C 6101131
4 4

93.22$                                          

6
1.3

31-II

Ecolab

15 OF 21



 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Betco Green Earth® Peroxide Cleaner,
Four (4) two (2) liters per CS
NO BRAND, PRODUCT OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

40 EA 122.00$           4,880.0000$    $121.82 4,872.8000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Continental Multi-Guard Surface Disinfectant, 
One (1)  QT per PK, twelve (12) PK per CS
NO BRAND,PRODUCT OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

180 EA

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

Betco

GE Peroxide
3364700

4
2

LTR
121.82$                                        
30.46$                                          

2.00000000
0.4500$                                        

122.00$                                      

0.0070$                                      

No Bid34-KK No Bid No Bid

33-JJ

Betco

30.50$                                        

LTR

0.01562000$                              

4
2

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Green Earth Peroxide Cleaner
BT-33647

No Bid
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Glass Cleaner, Concentrated
Maximum of 2.5 GL Containers 1 EA 93.16$             93.1600$           124.00$           124.0000$       105.99$           105.9900$         $76.22 76.2200$           

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Renown Antibacterial Foaming Hand Soap,
1200 ml Cartridge, two (2) per CS
NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

50 EA 72.53$             3,626.5000$       

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Commercial Grade Degreaser
Four (4) one (1) GL Containers ONLY
NO SIZE SUBSTITUTES

16 EA 45.51$             728.1600$         48.48$             775.6800$          39.46$             631.3600$         $58.03 928.4800$         

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

14.51$                                          
2.00000000

0.9000$                                        

Green Earth Glass Cleaner
5350400

4
1

GL
76.22$                                          
19.06$                                          

2.00000000
0.1400$                                        

Betco

Factory Formula HP
1930400

4
1

GL
58.03$                                          

Betco

6100288
1
3

GL
93.16$                                          

0.03125000
0.0091$                                        

124.00$                                      
31.00$                                        

0.01562000$                              
0.0071$                                      

2

35-LL

Ecolab Ecolab

Glass Cleaner

93.16$                                          

GL
105.99$                                        

1
3No Bid

Peroxide Glass + All Purpose 
Cleaner
6100302

0.0047$                                        

Betco

Spartan BH-38 1 Gallon Industrial 
Degreaser

1200

Clear Image
BT-19947

4

No Bid

2
LTR

No Bid4.00
1 1.00

12.12$                                          9.87$                                            
1.00000000 0.06800000

GL

GreaseCutter Plus

4 4.00
1.00

105.99$                                        
0.50000000

No Bid

GL
45.51$                                          48.48$                                          39.46$                                          

GL

0.0889$                                        0.0017$                                        

6119513 SPA2038-04 6119513

No Bid

Renown 1,200 ml Touch-Free 
Antibacterial Foam hand Soap

REN02544

No Bid36-MM

Renown

36.27$                                          

ML
72.53$                                          

37-NN

Ecolab Spartan Ecolab

GreaseCutter Plus

11.38$                                          
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

All Purpose Cleaner/Degreaser (CHROME)
Maximum of 2.5 GL Containers 124 EA 82.01$             10,169.2400$    81.99$             10,166.7600$    $77.15 9,566.6000$      

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Betco Extreme Floor Stripper,
5 GL Pail,
NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

16 EA 131.40$           2,102.4000$    $118.11 1,889.7600$      

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

184B500
1
5

GL
118.11$                                        
118.11$                                        

10.00000000
1.8500$                                        

Betco

Citrus Chisel
1674700

4
2

LTR
77.15$                                          
19.29$                                          

2.00000000
0.1400$                                        

Betco
Extreme

0.0001$                                        0.0080$                                        

0.0160$                                      

131.40$                                      
0.07812500$                              

GL
82.01$                                          81.99$                                          

131.40$                                      

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

0.03125000 0.00800000
82.01$                                          81.99$                                          

39-PP

Betco
Extreme Floor Stripper

BT-184B5-Z

5
GL

No Bid

38-OO

Ecolab Ecolab

Orange Force
Oasis 137 Orange Force All 
Purpose Cleaner Degreaser

6114559 6114559
1.00 1.00
2.50 2.50
GL

No Bid
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Betco Express Floor Finish,
5 GL Pail
NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

20 EA 135.51$           2,710.2000$    $102.88 2,057.6000$      

Brand Name:
Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
Coromatic Hardwound Roll Towel, White
8.25" x 700'
Six (6) rolls per CS
NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

40 EA 94.64$             3,785.6000$       

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

2500 per gal
RTU

Betco
Express

BIB658B5-00
1
5

GL
102.88$                                        
102.88$                                        

No Bid

0.0160$                                      

No Bid

Extreme Floor Finish
BT-658B5

N/A

135.51$                                      
135.51$                                      

No Bid

0.07812500$                              

40-QQ

Betco

N/A

RL

41-RR No Bid No Bid No Bid

Georgia Pacific
Cormatic White Hard Wound 

Towels Roll on 8.25 in. Non-Slot 
Rolls (6-Rolls Per Case, 700 ft.)

GPT2930P
6

8.25" x 700'

94.64$                                          
15.77$                                          

N/A

5
GL

No Bid
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

Renown Controlled Hard Roll Towel, Natural 
White 8" x 800'
Six (6) rolls per CS
NO BRAND, PRODUCT, OR SIZE 
SUBSTITUTES

114 EA 63.04$             7,186.5600$       

Brand Name:

Product Name:
Product Number:
Quantity per Case (CS):
Unit of Measure (UOM) per CS:
Unit of Measure (UOM):
Price per CS:
Price per UOM:
Dilution Rate per Ounce (OZ):
BIDDER Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):
STATE Clarification, BIDDER Approved
Price per Diluted Ounce (OZ):

N/A

8" x 800'

N/A

RL

N/A

No Bid

63.04$                                          

42-SS No Bid No Bid No Bid

Renown
Renown Natural White 8 in. 

Controlled Hardwound Paper 
Towels (800 ft. per Roll, 6-Rolls 

per Case)
REN06131-WB

6
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 Buyer: Clinton Paul 6840 OF
Attachment "A"

Bid Tab

LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

UNIT
PRICE

EXTENDED
PRICE

ODP Business SolutionsWarewashing, Laundry and Miscellaneous Chemicals and 
Supplies

National Everything WholesaleEcolab Inc Egan Supply Co. HD Supply

0 30 0 0 30
4 1-3

Non-Core Items
% OF DISCOUNT OFF REMAINDER OF CATALOG

YES          NO
__X____     ______

 DFL 50%

 DFL 50%

 DFL 50%

 DFL 50%

Payment Terms
Delivery Days ARO

0 45
7-10

26%

43

44
OTHER KITCHEN CHEMICALS

OTHER LAUNDRY CHEMICALS

OTHER HOUSEKEEPING CHEMICALS

OTHER MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

Varies by Item

Varies by Item

Varies by Item

Non-Core Items

Varies by Item

25%

15%

15%

15%

Section VI - FF, 3 - Product does 
not include optical brighteners

Comments ODP Business Solutions, LLC's 
response is contingent upon The 
State of Nebraska's acceptance 
of pricing, terms and conditions 

as set forth in
NASPO Cooperative Purchasing 
Program Master Agreement PA 
5737. The terms and conditions 
set forth in the NASPO Master 

Agreement are
the only terms and conditions 

applicable to this bid.

Note From Bidder: Most locations 
we deliver daily, however, there 

are some rural locations that may 
be once a month.

Note From Bidder: All prices 
contingent on no cost increases 

from manufacturers. If Contractor 
receives price increases,

Contractor will request a price 
increase with appropriate 

justification/documentation within 
30 days.

Section VI - VV, 2 - $350 
minimum order

Section VI - WW, 2 - Only 
bidding to deliver to Facility #'s 
1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 10, 11, 12, 
13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 19, 20, 21, 

22, 23, 24, & 25

26%

26%

30%

VENDOR CAN BLOCK AVAILABILITY OF CERTAIN NON‐CORE ITEMS IF 
REQUESTED BY THE STATE PURCHASING BUREAU (I.E., FURNITURE, OFFICE 

SUPPLIES):

YES          NO
______     __X___

YES          NO
___X___     ______

YES          NO
___X___     ______

YES          NO
__X____     ______

25%

25%

25%

15%
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